
3) Swimming Pool Passes – free
admittance to Lake Creek and
Micki Kresbach. Pool passes are
provided by the Human
Resources Department.

1) Round Rock Public Library –
free library card.Please apply in
person at the Library and
present your City ID badge and
your Texas issued ID with
current address.

2) Clay Madsen Recreation
Center – free employee
membership or discount on
family membership. Please
apply in person at the
Recreation Center and present
your City ID badge.

City Facilities

Employee Discounts
City of Round Rock

Please contact Human Resources if you have any suggestions for additional employee discounts.

2) CoreSpeed Fitness – free
classes for all employees and
any spouses/children who are
age 18 and above (spouses/
children must be enrolled with
the City’s health insurance).
Limited open gym hours for
employees. Please visit
EmployeeNet for the current
schedule of classes and limited
open gym hours.

1) Soul Strong Yoga – free
classes. Please visit
EmployeeNet for the current
schedule of classes.

Wellness

4) Enterprise Rental Car: variable
discount available for employees.
Use account number TX999 and
the pin TEX.

1) AT&T: 25% discount for
employees. Please apply in
person at any local AT&T provider
and present your City ID badge.

2) T-Mobile: 20% discount for
employees. Please apply in
person at any local T-Mobile
provider and present your City ID
badge.

3) Velocity Credit Union: free
checking account for employees.
Please apply in person at any
local Velocity Credit Union and
present your City ID badge.

Local Businesses


